

NOTIFICATION OF AWARD

CONTRACT #23: POLICE UNIFORMS AND EQUIPMENT

Contract Period: January 1, 2024 - December 31, 2024

NOTES:

- **All Purchase Orders must reference "MCCPC Contract #23"**
- No minimum order requirements are allowed
- Prices are to remain firm for the term of the contract with no exceptions
- Vendor is required to provide member with the artwork used to fabricate embroidered patches/badges – artworks remains/becomes property of member
- Vendor must provide on-site fitting and alterations for no additional charge – in addition to a salesperson, an experienced tailor/seamstress must come on-site to measure
- Vendor will be responsible for delivery of uniforms and equipment at no additional charge
- Vendor must have properly staffed and equipped store with an experienced alteration department
- Price to include delivery, FOB destination, freight prepaid
- For clothing purchased under this contract, there is no additional charge for alterations (the charges in Category G are for items not purchased under this contract)
- See Technical Specifications on website (www.mccpc.org) for detailed product information

VENDOR INFORMATION

Vendor: Atlantic Tactical, Inc.

Address: 653 Corporate Circle, New Cumberland, Pennsylvania 17070

Contact Person: Thomas Caruso

Title: Contract Administrator

Tel #: 717-774-3339, X151142

Fax #: 717-774-4463

E-Mail: tom.caruso@atlantictactical.com

ITEMS AWARDED

CAT. A: POLICE UNIFORMS – CLASS "A"	Description	Unit Price
1. Trousers, 55% poly, 45% wool blend		
a. Men's sizes:	Fechheimer 92280	\$129.12 / each
b. Women's sizes:	Fechheimer 47280W	\$129.12 / each
2. Trousers, 4-pocket pant, gold stripe to be sewn on		
a. Men's sizes:	Elbeco E314RN	\$75.69 / each
b. Women's sizes:	Elbeco E314RN	\$75.69 / each
3. Long sleeve shirts, flag and 8 NJ State Seal buttons (provided by vendor) and patch (provided by member) sewn on, to be available in white, navy and French blue		
a. Size S – XL:	Elbeco 584D, 589D, 580D	\$70.46 / each
b. Size 2XL – 6XL:	Elbeco 584D, 589D, 580D	\$70.46 / each
c. Size ST – XLT:	Elbeco 584D, 589D, 580D	\$70.46 / each
d. Size 2XL – 6XL:	Elbeco 584D, 589D, 580D	\$70.46 / each

CAT. A: POLICE UNIFORMS – CLASS “A”	Description	Unit Price
4. Short sleeve shirt, flag and 8 NJ State Seal buttons (provided by vendor) and patch (provided by member) sewn on, to be available in white, navy and French blue		
a. Size S – XL:	Elbeco 5584D, 5589D, 5580D	\$64.54 / each
b. Size 2XL – 6XL:	Elbeco 5584D, 5589D, 5580D	\$64.54 / each
c. Size ST – XLT:	Elbeco 5584D, 5589D, 5580D	\$64.54 / each
d. Size 2XLT – 6XLT:	Elbeco 5584D, 5589D, 5580D	\$64.54 / each
5. Long sleeve shirt (wool), flag and 8 NJ State Seal button (provided by vendor) and patch (provided by member) sewn on, to be available in white, navy and French blue		
a. Size S – XL:	Flying Cross 07W84	\$93.62 / each
b. Size 2XL – 6XL:	Flying Cross 07W84	\$121.71 / each
c. Size ST – XLT:	Flying Cross 07W84	\$121.71 / each
d. Size 2XLT – 6XLT:	Flying Cross 07W84	\$121.71 / each
6. Short sleeve shirt (wool), flag and 8 NJ State Seal buttons (provided by vendor) and patch (provided by member) sewn on, to be available in white, navy and French blue		
a. Size S – XL:	Flying Cross 54R84	\$83.65 / each
b. Size 2XL – 6XL:	Flying Cross 54R84	\$108.75 / each
c. Size ST – XLT:	Flying Cross 54R84	\$108.75 / each
d. Size 2XLT – 6XLT:	Flying Cross 54R84	\$108.75 / each
7. Long sleeve shirt, flag and 8 NJ State Seal buttons (provided by vendor) and patch (provided by member) sewn on, to be available in midnight navy		
a. Size S – XL:	Elbeco 314N	\$54.15 / each
b. Size 2XL – 6XL:	Elbeco 314N	\$54.15 / each
c. Size ST – XLT:	Elbeco 314N	\$54.15 / each
d. Size 2XLT – 6XLT:	Elbeco 314N	\$54.15 / each
8. Long sleeve shirt, flag and 8 NJ State Seal buttons (provided by vendor) and patch (provided by member) sewn on, to be available in white		
a. Size S – XL:	Elbeco 310N	\$54.15 / each
b. Size 2XL – 6XL:	Elbeco 310N	\$54.15 / each
c. Size ST – XLT:	Elbeco 310N	\$54.15 / each
d. Size 2XLT – 6XLT:	Elbeco 310N	\$54.15 / each
9. Women’s blouse, long sleeve (identical specs to Item #3), flag and 8 NJ State Seal buttons (provided by vendor) and patch (provided by member) sewn on, to be available in white, navy and French blue		
a. Size S – XL:	Elbeco 9584LCD, 9589LCD, 9580LCD	\$70.46 / each
b. Size 2XL – 6XL:	Elbeco 9584LCD, 9589LCD, 9580LCD	\$70.46 / each
10. Women’s blouse, short sleeve (identical specs to Item #4), flag and 8 NJ State Seal buttons (provided by vendor) and patch (provided by member) sewn on, to be available in white, navy and French blue		
a. Size S – XL:	Elbeco 9584LCD, 9589LCD, 9580LCD	\$64.54 / each
b. Size 2XL – 6XL:	Elbeco 9584LCD, 9589LCD, 9580LCD	\$64.54 / each
CLASS “B” AND CLASS “C”		

CAT. A: POLICE UNIFORMS – CLASS “A”	Description	Unit Price
11. Long sleeve shirt, poly/cotton blend. Patch (provided by member) and flag (provided by vendor) sewn on, collar tabs (provided by vendor) sewn on or direct embroidered as directed by member.		
a. Size S – XL:	Blauer 8705	\$73.75 / each
b. Size 2XL – 6XL:	Blauer 8705	\$95.88 / each
b. Size ST – XLT:	Blauer 8705	\$95.88 / each
c. Size 2XLT – 6XLT:	Blauer 8705	\$95.88 / each
12. Short sleeve shirt, poly/cotton blend. Patch (provided by member) and flag (provided by vendor) sewn on, collar tabs (provided by vendor) sewn on or direct embroidered as directed by member.		
a. Size S – XL:	Blauer 8715	\$63.42 / each
b. Size 2XL – 6XL:	Blauer 8715	\$82.45 / each
c. Size ST – XLT:	Blauer 8715	\$82.45 / each
d. Size 2XLT – 6XLT:	Blauer 8715	\$82.45 / each
13. Long sleeve shirt, twill. Patch (provided by member) and flag (provided by vendor) sewn on, collar tabs (provided by vendor) sewn on or direct embroidered as directed by member.		
a. Size S – XL:	Elbeco G924	\$65.28 / each
b. Size 2XL – 6XL:	Elbeco G924	\$65.28 / each
c. Size ST – XLT:	Elbeco G92	\$65.28 / each
d. Size 2XLT – 6XLT:	Elbeco G92	\$65.28 / each
14. Short sleeve shirt, twill. Patch (provided by member) and flag (provided by vendor) sewn on, collar tabs (provided by vendor) sewn on or direct embroidered as directed by member.		
a. Size S – XL:	Elbeco G934	\$60.20 / each
b. Size 2XL – 6XL:	Elbeco G934	\$60.20 / each
c. Size ST – XLT:	Elbeco G934	\$60.20 / each
d. Size 2XLT – 6XLT:	Elbeco G934	\$60.20 / each
15. Vest, front opening. Includes ID patch on back of vest (8.5" x 3" block lettering, choice of gray or gold, POLICE), name tape all block, velcro tape color black, 1/2" lettering in gray or gold. Department badge embroidered on velcro tape, black, patrol and superior officers.		
a. Size S – XL:	Safariland 1303518-OC DN6566	\$246.15 / each
b. Size 2XL – 5XL:	Safariland 1303518-OC DN6566	\$246.15 / each
c. Size ST – XLT:	Safariland 1303518-OC DN6566	\$246.15 / each
d. Size 2XLT – 5XLT:	Safariland 1303518-OC DN6566	\$246.15 / each
16. Base shirt, long sleeve, 12 oz. poly/cotton blend (to be available in dark navy). Patch (provided by member) and flag (provided by member) sewn on, collar tabs (provided by vendor) sewn on or direct embroidered as directed by member.		
a. Size S – XL:	Blauer 8781	\$76.97 / each
b. Size 2XL – 5XL:	Blauer 8781	\$100.06 / each
c. Size ST – XLT:	Blauer 8781	100.06 / each
d. Size 2XLT – 5XLT:	Blauer 8781	\$100.06 / each

CAT. A: POLICE UNIFORMS – CLASS “A”	Description	Unit Price
17. Base shirt, short sleeve, 12 oz. poly/cotton blend (to be available in dark navy). Patch (provided by member) and flag (provided by vendor) sewn on, collar tabs (provided by vendor) sewn on or direct embroidered as directed by member.		
a. Size S – XL:	Blauer 8782	\$70.17 / each
b. Size 2XL – 5XL:	Blauer 8782	\$91.22 / each
c. Size ST – XLT:	Blauer 8782	\$91.22 / each
d. Size 2XLT – 5XLT:	Blauer 8782	\$91.22 / each
18. Long sleeve shirt (to be available in navy). Patch (provide by member) and flag (provided by vendor) sewn on, collar tabs (provided by vendor) sewn on or direct embroidered as directed by member.		
a. Size S – XL:	Elbeco UVS234	\$105.51 / each
b. Size 2XL – 5XL:	Elbeco UVS234	\$105.51 / each
c. Size ST – XLT:	Elbeco UVS234	\$105.51 / each
d. Size 2XLT – 5XLT:	Elbeco UVS234	\$105.51 / each
19. Long sleeve shirt (to be available in dark navy). Patch (provided by member) and flag (provided by vendor) sewn on, collar tabs (provided by vendor) sewn on or direct embroidered as directed by member.		
a. Size S – XL:	Elbeco UVS141	\$62.28 / each
b. Size 2XL – 5XL:	Elbeco UVS141	\$62.28 / each
c. Size ST – XLT:	Elbeco UVS141	\$62.28 / each
d. Size 2XLT – 5XLT:	Elbeco UVS141	\$62.28 / each
20. Short sleeve shirt (to be available in dark navy). Patch (provided by member) and flag (provided by vendor) sewn on, collar tabs (provided by vendor) sewn on or direct embroidered as directed by member.		
a. Size S – XL:	Elbeco UVS142	\$58.43 / each
b. Size 2XL – 5XL:	Elbeco UVS142	\$58.43 / each
c. Size ST – XLT:	Elbeco UVS142	\$58.43 / each
d. Size 2XLT – 5XLT:	Elbeco UVS142	\$58.43 / each
21. Polo shirt, short sleeve, hi-viz, ANSI / ISEA 107-2015 Class II, comfort trim, quarter zip front, knit collar and cuffs, centered mic tab, must say “POLICE”, 4” letters, non-reflective.		
a. Size S – XL:	Blauer 8137	\$84.58 / each
b. Size 2XL – 5XL:	Blauer 8137	\$109.95 / each
c. Size ST – XLT:	Blauer 8137	\$109.95 / each
d. Size 2XLT – 5XLT:	Blauer 8137	\$109.05 / each
22. Polo shirt, long sleeve, hi-viz, ANSI / ISEA 107-2015 Class II, comfort trim, quarter zip front, knit collar and cuffs, centered mic tab, must say “POLICE”, 4” letters, non-reflective.		
a. Size S – XL:	Blauer 8147	\$92.92 / each
b. Size 2XL – 5XL:	Blauer 8147	\$120.80 / each
c. Size ST – XLT:	Blauer 8147	\$120.80 / each
d. Size 2XLT – 5XLT:	Blauer 8147	\$120.80 / each
23. Sweater, fleece-lined, v-neck, reverse flag (provided by vendor) and custom patch (provided by member) sewn on.		

CAT. A: POLICE UNIFORMS – CLASS “A”	Description	Unit Price
a. Size S – XL:	Blauer 225	\$117.78 / each
b. Size 2XL – 5XL:	Blauer 225	\$153.11 / each
c. Size ST – XLT:	Blauer 225	\$153.11 / each
d. Size 2XLT – 5XLT:	Blauer 225	\$153.11 / each
24. Polo shirt, short sleeve, moisture wicking, dual pen pockets, 3-button placket, 100% polyester, integrated mic loops at shoulders and chest		
a. Size S – XL:	5.11 71049	\$38.29 / each
b. Size 2XL – 5XL:	5.11 71049	\$45.95 / each
c. Size ST – XLT:	5.11 71049	\$45.95 / each
d. Size 2XLT – 5XLT:	5.11 71049	\$45.95 / each
25. Polo shirt, long sleeve, moisture wicking, dual pen pockets, 3-button placket, 100% polyester, integrated mic loops at shoulders and chest		
a. Size S – XL:	5.11 72049	\$41.32 / each
b. Size 2XL – 5XL:	5.11 72049	\$49.58 / each
c. Size ST – XLT:	5.11 72049	\$49.58 / each
d. Size 2XLT – 5XLT:	5.11 72049	\$49.58 / each
26. Short sleeve shirt, crew neck, moisture wicking, sleeve pocket with hook & loop closure, poly/spandex/fiber mesh blend, color to be determined at time of order		
a. Size S – XL:	Condor 101117	\$27.00 / each
b. Size 2XL – 5XL:	Condor 101117	\$35.10 / each
c. Size ST – XLT:	Condor 101117	\$35.10 / each
d. Size 2XLT – 5XLT:	Condor 101117	\$35.10 / each
27. Long sleeve shirt, crew neck, moisture wicking, sleeve pocket with hook & loop closure, poly/spandex/fiber mesh blend, color to be determined at time of order		
a. Size S – XL:	Condor 101206	\$30.38 / each
b. Size 2XL – 5XL:	Condor 101206	\$39.49 / each
c. Size ST – XLT:	Condor 101206	\$39.49 / each
d. Size 2XLT – 5XLT:	Condor 101206	\$39.49 / each
28. Option for Items #11 - #24 above: Cost per item for direct embroidery of badge for patrol officers:	Atlantic Tactical	\$12.50 / each
29. Option for Items #11 - #24 above: Cost per item for direct embroidery of badge for superior officers:	Atlantic Tactical	\$12.50 / each
30. Option for Items #11 - #24 above: Cost per item for sewing of name tape or direct embroidery of name:	Atlantic Tactical	\$12.50 / each
31. Option for Items #11 - #24 above: Cost per item for direct embroidery of collars (ex. “RT”/“PD”), thread to be same color as name and badge:	Atlantic Tactical	\$12.50 / each
32. Trousers, navy, no stripe, NJDOC		

CAT. A: POLICE UNIFORMS – CLASS “A”	Description	Unit Price
a. Men’s sizes:	Elbeco E7427R	\$66.08 / each
b. Women’s sizes:	Elbeco E7427R	\$66.08 / each
33. Trousers, no stripe, poly/cotton blend, back hip pockets with angled flap and hook and loop closure, L-pockets with reinforced knife slot, cargo pockets with interior mag pouches and cell phone pocket (to be available in dark navy).		
a. Men’s sizes	Blauer 8831	\$78.85 / each
b. Women’s sizes	Blauer 8831	\$78.85 / each
34. Trousers (to be available in dark navy), no stripe		
a. Men’s sizes	Elbeco E7364R	\$73.69 / each
b. Women’s sizes	Elbeco E7364R	\$73.69 / each
35. Flag, forward/reverse (purchase and sewn on):	Hero’s Pride	\$2.50 / each
36. Sergeant stripes, cloth, colors to be selected by member police department (purchase and sewn on):	Hero’s Pride	\$7.00 / pair
37. Gold bars, Lieutenant, and Captain (purchase and sewn on):	Hero’s Pride	\$4.50 / pair
38. Chief stars (purchase and sewn on):	Hero’s Pride	\$4.50 / pair
39. Hash marks (purchase and sewn on):	Hero’s Pride	\$4.50 / each
40. Traffic safety wheel (purchase and sewn on):	Hero’s Pride	\$3.75 / each
41. Price to sew patches, hash marks, chevrons, bars, stars, flags, etc. for clothing items purchased in Category A unless otherwise noted above		\$3.50 / each
42. Price to purchase patches, hash marks, chevrons, bars, stars, flags, etc. for clothing items purchased in Category A unless otherwise noted above		\$3.50 / each
Delivery Days, Category A:		60 days ARO

CAT. B: POLICE CLOTHING	Description	Unit Price
1. Raincoats with hi-viz yellow:	Blauer 736	\$198.67 / each
2. Rain cover for hats with hi-viz yellow:	Blauer 107	\$13.33 / each
3. Trooper hats with NJ overhead straps (black), NJ back cap strap (black), and band (silver/gold):	Keystone-Sentry R801NJ	\$76.08 / each
4. Baseball caps, black, with police patch (provided by member) sewn on:	Flexfit 6277	\$11.77 / each
5. Baseball cap, black, patch (provided by member) sewn on:	Blauer 182	\$15.57 / each
6. Baseball cap:	Blauer 188	\$12.00 / each
7. Skull cap (to be available in black and navy blue):	Blauer 160	\$25.67 / each
8. Option for Items #4, #5, #6 and #7 above: Direct embroidery of badge number for caps:	Atlantic Tactical	\$12.50 / each
9. Hats (wool watch caps) for winter use:	Rothco 8492	\$7.05 / each
10. Option for Item #9 above: Direct embroidery of police patch	Atlantic Tactical	\$12.50 / each
11. Handcuffs, nickel:	Peerless 700C	\$26.15 / each

CAT. B: POLICE CLOTHING	Description	Unit Price
12. Clip handcuff key:	ASP 56250	\$11.69 / each
13. Garrison belt, smooth:	PM Belts 1303	\$9.62 / each
14. Garrison belt, basketweave:	PM Belts 1304	\$10.26 / each
15. Garrison belt, Velcro, for under duty belt:	Safariland 99	\$29.14 / each
16. Ties, clip-on type:	Samuel Broome 900	\$5.26 / each
17. Jackets, light weight, hi-viz yellow and black. Patch (provided by member), flag and four (4) NJ state seal buttons (choice of silver or gold) (provided by vendor) sewn on.	Blauer 6001	\$189.33 / each
18. Jackets, with liner, dark navy. Patch (provided by member), flag and four (4) NJ state seal buttons (choice of silver or gold) (provided by vendor) sewn on:	Blauer 6100	\$169.33 / each
19. Jacket, ANSI 107-2015 certified, must say "POLICE", 4" reflective, reverse flag (provided by vendor) and patch (provided by member) sewn on, sizes S – 2XL:	Blauer 9970-50	\$501.40 / each
20. Parka, 5.11 Bristol Parka #48152 or equiv., range red (477), must say "INSTRUCTOR" (3" letters) in yellow, flag (provided by vendor) and firearms instructor patch (provided by member) sewn on, sizes S – 2XL	5.11 48152	\$278.60 / each
21. Gloves, hi-viz, waterproof, microfleece lining, touch screen-friendly fingertips:	Blauer GL200	\$54.67 / pair
22. Gloves, black leather with wool inserts and wrist straps:	Damascus DLD40	\$16.41 / pair
23. Search gloves, black leather, elastic wrist (similar to driving gloves), duty cut resistant:	Hatch RFK300	\$29.62 / pair
24. Traffic safety glove, hi-viz yellow, flexible, reflective stripes on hands:	Finger Fashions 470	\$19.87 / pair
25. Tactical boots, all colors:	Under Armour 3023743	\$95.19 / pair
26. Slush boots, heavy duty, knee-high, black:	Tingley 1400	\$58.21 / pair
27. 2.25" duty belt with 3X buckle, leather/laminate, nylon-look finish, sizes S (26" – 32"), M (32" – 38"), LG (38" – 44"):	Safariland 94B	\$57.41 / each
28. Nylon belt buckle for 2.25" duty belt. Must be compatible with #27 above.	Bianchi B9405-2-225	\$3.21 / each
29. Holster, with duty guard, Level II, STX 6365, top grain, S&W M&P .45:	Safariland 6365	\$99.23 / each
30. Double magazine pouch with black snaps in STX TAC finish for S&W magazines:	Safariland 77	\$30.00 / each
31. Spray holder top flap with black snaps in STX TAC finish (Fox Labs OC Spray 2 oz. container):	Safariland 38	\$21.06 / each
32. 2-Snap Belt Keeper with black snap STX TAC finish:	Safariland 65	\$3.04 / each
33. Belt keeper with Hide-A-Keyper hidden handcuff key with black snaps, nylon-look finish:	Gould & Goodrich B2096	\$6.04 / each
34. Gear clip duty belt:	Safariland 7379	\$40.38 / each

CAT. B: POLICE CLOTHING	Description	Unit Price
35. Tactical mic clip:	TMK TMK4000	\$7.37 / each
36. Open top formed standard handcuff pouch in STX TAC finish:	Safariland 90	\$25.10 / each
37. Single handcuff pouch top flap with black snaps in STX TAC finish:	Safariland 190	\$30.00 / each
38. Double handcuff pouch top flap with black snaps in STX TAC finish:	Safariland 290	\$34.62 / each
39. Open top magazine and handcuff pouch:	Safariland 573	\$34.33 / each
40. Handcuff strap-snap:	Safariland 690	\$11.54 / each
41. Whistle, gold or silver:	Hero's Pride 4010N	\$4.08 / each
42. Snake chain for whistle, gold or silver (must be compatible with #41 above):	Hero's Pride 4020N	\$3.49 / each
43. Glove pouch:	Safariland 33	\$16.29 / each
44. Safety vest, Class II, zipper front, hi-viz, must say "POLICE":	Spiewak S912	\$34.82 / each
45. Shirt, heatgear compression short sleeve t-shirt:	Under Armour 1216007	\$16.03 / each
46. Shirt, tactical mock, long sleeve, black:	Under Armour 1365388	\$38.46 / each
47. Shirt, tactical mock, long sleeve, black, neck embroidered with police name abbreviation with department choice of thread color:	Under Armour 1365388	\$43.59 / each
48. Shirt, tactical crew base, long sleeve, black	Under Armour 1365389	\$38.46 / each
49. Shirt, tactical tech shirt, short sleeve, black	Under Armour 1005684	\$16.03 / each
50. Shirt, women's heatgear, long sleeve	Under Armour 1235253	\$21.15 / each
51. Shirt, women's heatgear, short sleeve	Under Armour 1235253	\$16.03 / each
52. Shirt, women's tactical mock, long sleeve, neck embroidered with police name abbreviation with department choice of thread color:	Under Armour 1365393	\$43.59 / each
53. Shirt, women's tactical mock:	Under Armour 1365393	\$38.46 / each
54. Leggings, men's/women's:	Under Armour 1365395	\$38.46 / each
55. Ridge pants:	5.11 74520	\$54.69 / each
56. Briefs, 6", black:	5.11 40186	\$19.50 / each
57. Price to sew patches, hash marks, chevrons, bars, stars, flags, etc. for clothing items purchased in Category B unless otherwise noted above:		\$3.50 / each
58. Price to purchase patches, hash marks, chevrons, bars, stars, flags, etc. for clothing items purchased in Category B unless otherwise noted above:		\$3.50 / each
Delivery Days, Category B:		60 days ARO

CAT. C: POLICE EQUIPMENT	Description	Unit Price
---------------------------------	--------------------	-------------------

CAT. C: POLICE EQUIPMENT	Description	Unit Price
1. Flashlight:		
a. ML150 rechargeable LED flashlight:	MagLite ML150	\$148.47 / each
b. ML 150LR battery pack:	MagLite ML150LR-CC	\$45.24 / each
c. Lithium 3V batteries, 12 per pack:	ASP 3028	\$23.38 / pack
d. Replacement bulb:	MagLite LR0001L	\$4.95 / each
e. Tactical 4.77" LED flashlight with clip or equiv.:	Streamlight ProTac 2L	\$52.21 / each
f. Belt ring carrier for flashlight:	MagLite ASXC046	\$8.21 / each
g. Keychain flashlight, LED, lithium:	Streamlight 63001	\$12.50 / each
2. Night stick/belt ring carrier for night stick		
a. Night stick, black, plastic with rubber ring:	Monadnock 1101	\$113.74 / each
b. Expandable batons:	Monadnock 9130/F	\$146.81 / each
c. Holster for MED, swivel holder with 2" autolock:	Monadnock 3034	\$30.60 / each
d. Holster for MED, swivel holder with 2" autolock:	Monadnock 3030	\$27.96 / each
e. Belt ring carriers for night sticks, in rhodium electroplate and gold electroplate:	Safariland 692S	\$13.27 / each
3. Nameplates, in rhodium electroplate and gold electroplate:	Smith & Warren C600	\$29.81 / each
4. Nameplate attachment "Serving Since" in rhodium electroplate and gold electroplate (compatible with #3 above):	Smith & Warren C600A	\$21.15 / each
5. Duty badge cases, embossed with choice of color, must be compatible with #14a, #14d, #14e and #14f below:	Strong 75500	\$11.56 / each
6. Classic badge wallet, embossed, must be compatible with #14a, #14d, #14e and #14f below:	Strong 89610	\$21.88 / each
7. Tri-fold wallet, dress, single ID, 5 credit card slots, must be compatible with #14a, #14d, #14e and #14f below:	Smith & Warren BC105	\$46.15 / each
8. Duty bags:	5.11 59012	\$49.63 / each
9. Triangular embroidered collar tabs, gold or silver, custom to department, sold in packs of 100:	Hero's Pride	\$142.00 / pack
10. Triangular embroidered collar tabs, gold or silver, sold in packs of 100:	Hero's Pride	\$142.00 / pack
11. Police department shoulder patches, plastic backing, sold in packs of 100:	Hero's Pride	\$515.00 / pack
12. Police department hat patches, plastic backing, 3" x 2.5", sold in packs of 100:	Hero's Pride	\$258.00 / pack
13. Police department chest patches, with Velcro sewn on back, sold in packs of 100:	Hero's Pride	\$515.00 / pack
14. Citation bar holders, 1-6 holes, no name plate:	Jaypee 274	\$5.13 / each

CAT. C: POLICE EQUIPMENT	Description	Unit Price
15. Badges, cote d'or metal (gold) and sil-ray (silver) unless stated otherwise below:		
a. Patrol Badge:	Smith & Warren S141	\$110.26 / each
b. Hat Badge:	Smith & Warren S103	\$107.05 / each
c. Hat Badge:	Smith & Warren S103A	\$110.26 / each
d. Detective Badge:	Smith & Warren S24X	\$161.54 / each
e. Badge:	Smith & Warren S225	\$113.46 / each
f. Badge, 2.22" x 2.83":	Smith & Warren S24X	\$161.54 / each
g. Chief's Badge, gold electroplate:	Smith & Warren S669EO	\$136.54 / each
h. Mini Badge, 1.45" x 1.67":	Smith & Warren S287	\$99.04 / each
i. Mini Badge, 1.01" x 1.15":	Smith & Warren S305NJ	\$95.83 / each
j. Mini Badge, 1.31" x 1.5":	Smith & Warren S293	\$99.04 / each
k. Collar Wreath, gold, 1/2" with periods, sold in pairs:	Smith & Warren M427	\$29.48 / pair
l. Collar Chevrons, gold, sold in pairs:	Smith & Warren E314	\$13.14 / pair
m. Chief Brass Stars, 1/2", gold, sold in pairs:	Smith & Warren C520S	\$25.00 / pair
n. Lieutenant Bars, 1/2", gold, sold in pairs:	Smith & Warren C534	\$13.14 / pair
o. Collar Tabs, 1/2", silver, sold in pairs:	Smith & Warren C501M	\$15.71 / pair
p. Badge holder, clip on (compatible with 15a, 15d, 15e and 15f above):	Perfect Fit 716	\$12.92 / each
16. Tie bar, rhodium electroplate or gold electroplate, black lettering:	Blackinton A4002	\$25.00 / each
17. New Jersey Police Manual, paperback, current edition:	Gann Law NJ Police Manual	\$139.74 / each
Delivery Days, Category C:		45 days ARO

CAT. D: CITATION BARS	Description	Unit Price
1. Citation bars		
a. The Patriot	No Bid	No Bid
b. The Posthumous Bar	No Bid	No Bid
c. Medal of Honor (Green)	No Bid	No Bid
d. Combat Cross	No Bid	No Bid
e. Wounded in Combat	No Bid	No Bid
f. National Defense	No Bid	No Bid

CAT. D: CITATION BARS	Description	Unit Price
g. Grand Cordon	No Bid	No Bid
h. Meritorious	No Bid	No Bid
i. Exceptional Duty	No Bid	No Bid
j. Honorable Service	No Bid	No Bid
k. Life Saving	No Bid	No Bid
l. 15 Years of Service	No Bid	No Bid
m. Chief's Achievement	No Bid	No Bid
n. Educational Achievement	No Bid	No Bid
o. Honorable Bar	No Bid	No Bid
p. Military	No Bid	No Bid

CAT. E: DISPATCHER UNIFORMS	Description	Unit Price
1. Shirt, long sleeve		
a. Size S – XL:	Elbeco P824	\$43.38 / each
b. Size 2XL – 6XL:	Elbeco P824	\$43.38 / each
2. Shirt, short sleeve		
a. Size S – XL:	Elbeco P834	\$38.31 / each
b. Size 2XL – 6XL:	Elbeco P834	\$38.31 / each
3. Trousers, no stripe:	Liberty 600MNV	\$32.62 / each
4. Trousers, with stripe:	Liberty 600MNV	\$49.92 / each
5. Price to sew patches, hash marks, chevrons, bars, stars, flags, etc. for clothing items purchased in Category E unless otherwise noted above:		\$3.50 / each
6. Price to purchase patches, hash marks, chevrons, bars, stars, flags, etc. for clothing items purchased in Category E unless otherwise noted above:		\$3.50 / each
Delivery Days, Category E:		60 days ARO

CAT. F: SCHOOL CROSSING GUARDS	Description	Unit Price
1. Winter coat, ¾ length, patch (provided by member) and flag and rocker (provided by vendor) sewn on:	Blauer 6110	\$178.60 / each
2. ANSI III Hi-Viz parka, patch (provided by member) and flag and rocker (provided by vendor) sewn on:	Jerome Cutting 677T with 626T	\$225.65 / each
3. Parka, 3-in-1 reversible hi-viz parka, with patch (provided by member), flag and rocker (provided by vendor) sewn on:	5.11 #48033	\$223.57 / each
4. Blouse, short sleeve, patch (provided by member) and flag and rocker (provided by vendor) sewn on		

CAT. F: SCHOOL CROSSING GUARDS	Description	Unit Price
a. Size S – XL:	Elbeco P868	\$44.72 / each
5. Blouse, long sleeve, patch (provided by member) and flag and rocker (provided) by vendor) sewn on		
a. Size S – XL:	Elbeco P878	\$49.80 / each
6. Slacks, no stripe:	Liberty 600MNV	\$32.62 / each
7. Raincoat:	Liberty 586MFL	\$62.63 / each
8. Gloves, white wool:	Finger Fashions 420	\$4.49 / pair
9. Gloves, hi-viz yellow, waterproof:	Finger Fashions 470	\$19.87 / pair
10. Hand-held stop signs:	MTS O-SSCE18	\$11.86 / each
11. Hand-held stop paddle/sign, 18" octagon plus handle, LED on both sides, rechargeable:	Safety Sign Y5001-UB	\$298.55 / each
12. School crossing guard shoes (black tie shoes), Oxfords, leather:	Bates E22233	\$62.82 / pair
13. School crossing guard safety vest, Class II, hi-viz yellow, zip front:	Jerome Cutting 124CG	\$24.36 / each
14. Plastic whistle, black:	HWC ACME-4	\$2.47 / each
15. Crossing guard rocker patch:	Hero's Pride	\$4.23 / each
16. Baseball caps, black, with rocker sewn on (rocker provided by member):	Flexfit 6277	\$14.04 / each
17. Price to sew patches, hash marks, chevrons, bars, stars, flags, etc. for clothing items purchased in Category F unless otherwise noted above:		\$3.50 / each
18. Price to purchase patches, hash marks, chevrons, bars, stars, flags, etc. for clothing items purchased in Category F unless otherwise noted above:		\$3.50 / each
Delivery Days, Category F:		60 days ARO

CAT. G: COURT OFFICER EQUIPMENT	Description	Unit Price
1. Court Officer patch (purchase and sewn on):	No Bid	No Bid
2. Trousers, uniform, poly/cotton blend, black:	No Bid	No Bid
3. Boots, 5" tactical sport, black:	No Bid	No Bid
4. Shoes, gloss, oxford, black:	No Bid	No Bid
5. Price to sew patches, hash marks, chevrons, bars, stars, flags, etc. for clothing items purchased in Category G unless otherwise noted above:		
6. Price to purchase patches, hash marks, chevrons, bars, stars, flags, etc. for clothing items purchased in Category G unless otherwise noted above:		

CAT. H: MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS	Unit Price
1. Price to embroider badge for patrol officer (template provided by member) for clothing items not purchased under this contract or as specified elsewhere herein:	\$12.50 / each

CAT. H: MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS	Unit Price
2. Price to embroider badge for superior officer (template provided by member) for clothing items not purchased under this contract or as specified elsewhere herein:	\$12.50 / each
3. Price to embroider name for clothing items not purchased under this contract or as specified elsewhere herein:	\$8.00 / each
4. Price to remove patches, hash marks, chevrons, lt. bars, chief stars, flag, etc., for clothing items not purchased under this contract or as specified elsewhere herein:	\$2.00 / each
5. Price for following miscellaneous alterations for clothing not purchased under contract or specified elsewhere herein:	
a. Taking pants in:	\$14.50 / pair
b. Letting pants out:	\$14.50 / pair
c. Adjusting hems on trousers:	\$4.00 / pair
d. Adjusting sleeves on shirts:	\$4.00 / each
e. Taking shirts in:	\$16.50 / each
f. Coats/jackets:	\$8.50 / each
g. Repair of zippers on outer vests:	\$8.50 / each
6. Price for following items to be purchased and sewn on to items not purchased under this contract or specified elsewhere herein:	
a. Flag:	\$2.25 / each
b. Sergeant stripes:	\$7.00 / each
c. NJ State Seal Buttons (set of 8):	\$16.62 / set
d. Gold bars:	\$5.50 / each
e. Stars:	\$4.50 / each
f. Hash marks:	\$4.50 / each
g. Traffic safety wheel:	\$3.75 / each
h. Department patch:	\$7.75 / each
Delivery Days, Category H:	45 days ARO