m' ' p' IDENTIFIER: 6MOCCP
C

MORRIS COUNTY OOPERATIVE PRICING COUNCIL
A SHARED SERVICES SUCCESS STORY SINCE 1974 NOT'F'CAT'ON OF AWARD

Rev. 1 — Category B item #29.a re-awarded to Olympic Glove & Safety Company. 7/2/2024

Rev. 2 — Category A item #25.a brand name corrected to ‘Raid’. 7/17/2024

Rev. 3 — Category A item #27.a re-awarded to Pacific Star Corporation and Cat. A item #27.c award rescinded, no award
issued. 10/01/2024

CONTRACT #25: JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
Contract Period: July 1, 2024 — June 30, 2025

When ordering, please note:

o “MCCPC Identifier: 6MOCCP” and “MCCPC Contract #25” and “all materials must be delivered inside of the building” should appear on all
purchase orders.

e Prices are to remain firm for the term of the contract. Unless otherwise noted by the MCCPC, minimum order requirements are not

allowed.

All prices include delivery. All orders must be delivered inside the building of the agency placing the order at no additional charge.

If your entity is not tax-exempt it is your responsibility to notify the vendor. Appropriate taxes will be added to your order.

Vendors are to provide products exactly as described below at the prices stated. No substitutions are allowed.

Any dispensers required for liquid soap, paper towels, toilet seat covers, and the like shall be supplied by the vendor at no additional cost for
the duration of the contract.

Material Safety Data Sheets for all chemical products must be supplied by the vendor at the time of delivery.

o Please see technical specifications for carpet care products requirements. Copies of the technical specifications can be found on the website
(www.mccpc.org) or by emailing the MCCPC (luhi@randolphnj.org).

Vendor: Central Poly-Bag Corporation

Address: 2400 Bedle Place, Linden, New Jersey 07036

Contact Person: David Freier Title: VP, Operations

Tel #: 908-862-7570 Fax #: 908-862-9019 E-Mail: orders@centralpoly.com
Delivery Days: Within 21 business days ARO

Note: Please add # “188998” to PO

Vendor: Interboro Packaging Corporation
Address: 114 Bracken Road, Montgomery, New York 12549

Notification of Award Contract #25: Page 1 of 18


http://www.mccpc.org/
mailto:luhl@randolphnj.org

Contact Person: Abraham Jeremias

Title: VP

Tel #: 845-782-6800 Fax #: 845-781-2450

E-Mail: abraham@interboropackaging.com

Delivery Days: 5 days ARO

Note: Please add “25 Janitorial Supplies” to PO

Vendor: Office Concepts Group

Address: 301 Greenwood Avenue, Midland Park, New Jersey 07432

Contact Person: Debbie Meola

Title: Account Manager

Tel #: 201-445-6555 Fax #: 201-493-9750

E-Mail: dmeola@officeconceptsgroup.com

Delivery Days: 5 days

Vendor: The Olympic Glove & Safety Company Inc.

Address: 75 Main Avenue, EImwood Park, New Jersey 07407

Contact Person: Jerry Lorenc

Title: Accounting Manager

Tel #: 201-794-9320 ex. 132 Fax #: 201-794-0804

E-Mail: jlorenc@olympicglove.com

Delivery Days: 5 — 10 days

Vendor: Pacific Star Corporation

Address: 4350 South Wayside Drive #106, Houston, Texas 77087

Contact Person: Angelica Delgado
Vonny Angellia

Title: Sales Manager
Sales Support

Tel #: 713-527-0889 Fax #: 713-481-8423

E-Mail: customer@pfstar.com

Delivery Days: 30 days

Vendor: Plastic Express, Inc.

Address: 667 Lehigh Avenue, Union, New Jersey 07083

Contact Person: Eddie H. Mardahaev

Title: Vice President
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Tel #: 718-499-1119 Fax #: 908-624-9090

E-Mail: bids@plex247.com

Delivery Days: 5 to 7 days ARO

Note: Please add “#25 / Janitorial Supplies” to PO

Vendor: RMAC Supplies

Address: 140 Ludlow Avenue, Northvale, New Jersey 07647

Contact Person: Ken Levitt

Title: Bid Sales

Tel #: 973-641-7533 Fax #: 201-833-7623

E-Mail: klevitt@rmacsupplies.com

Delivery Days: 5 days

Vendor: Spruce Industries, Inc.

Address: 759 E. Lincoln Avenue, Rahway, New Jersey 07065

Contact Person: Dan Josephs

Title: Ex Vp/COO

Tel #: 732-388-9091 Fax #: 732-388-9585

E-Mail: daniel.josephs@spruceindustries.com

Delivery Days: 5 days ARO

Vendor: Term Enterprises Inc. (dba Allen Paper & Supply Company)

Address: 85 Franklin Road Suite 7B, Dover, New Jersey 07801

Contact Person: Theresa A. Kral

Title: CEO

Tel #: 973-538-4826 Fax #: 973-538-1288

E-Mail: tkral@allenpapersupply.com

Delivery Days: Within 7 days, 5 business days

Vendor: United Sales USA Corp.

Address: 5902 14t Avenue, Brooklyn, New York 11219

Contact Person: Peri Noe

Title: Secretary

Tel #: 718-709-5900 Fax #: 718-709-7705

E-Mail: bids@unitedsalesusa.com
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Delivery Days: 1 —7 business days

CAT. A: CLEANSERS, DEODORIZERS, AND UNIT / CASE
SPECIAL PURPOSE ITEMS DI=EdlTeL. PRICE e
1. Multi-use powder cleaners, approx. 28 oz. container, 12 per case
a. Ajaxwith Bleach OR Comet with Bleach OR Ajax #105375 21 oz. 12/cs $44.38 / case Pacific Star Corp.
Spic-N-Span
b. Generic No Award No Award No Award
2. No-rinse liquid floor cleaner, concentrated, 1 gallon container, 4 per case
a. Generic Simoniz One Shot #02445004 4/1 gal. $17.50 / case Allen Paper
3. All-purpose liquid cleaner and disinfectant, must meet or exceed phenol coefficient #5, 1 gallon container, 4 per case
a. Pine Sol Multi-Surface & All-Purpose Cleaner OR
Mr. Clean Multi-Surface Antibacterial Cleaner, 1 CL035418CT Pine Sol 1 Gal; 4/ct $36.25/ case Office Concepts
gallon container
b. Generic RMAC, LS-41, 1 gal 4/cs LS-41 $14.95 / case RMAC Supplies
4. Multi-use spray disinfectant, approx.19 oz. can, 12 per case
a. ;frg;D'S'”feCtam Spray OR Clorox Disinfecting | | /o 1038504CT 19 0z/12/cs $67.63 / case United Sales USA
b. Generic DVOCBD540540 Diversey 19 oz, 12/ct $18.95 / case Office Concepts
5. All-purpose cleaner with bleach, 32 oz. spray bottle, 9 per case

a. Clorox Clean-Up With Bleach

Clorox CL031221 32 oz 9/cs

$47.63 / case

United Sales USA

b. Generic

GJ099666CT Genuine Joe 32 oz; 6/ct

$15.85 / case

Office Concepts
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CAT. A: CLEANSERS, DEODORIZERS, AND
SPECIAL PURPOSE ITEMS

DESCRIPTION

UNIT / CASE
PRICE

VENDOR

6. All-purpose cleaner with bleach, 64 oz. refill bottle, 6 per case

a. Clorox Clean-Up With Bleach

CLO035420CT Clorox 128 oz; 4/ct

$51.09 / case

Office Concepts

b. Generic Clorox Clean Up w/Bleach 4/128 oz. CLO035420 $56.80 / case Allen Paper
7. Ammonia
a. Generic, clear, 1 quart container No Award No Award No Award
b. Generic, extra strength, 5 gallon drum No Bid No Bid No Bid

8. Spray window cleaner, cap and trigger spray bottles, approx. 32 oz. bottles, 12 per case (includes 12 spray triggers)

a. Windex Glass Cleaner with Ammonia-D OR
Glass Plus Glass Cleaner

Windex 322338 32 oz 8/cs

$34.57 / case

United Sales USA

b. Generic

RMAC 12T 32 oz 12/cs GC-12T

$21.57 / case

RMAC Supplies

9. Spray outdoor glass and patio cleaner, cap and trigger

spray bottles, 32 oz., 12 per case (includes 12 spray triggers)

a. Windex Outdoor No Bid No Bid No Bid

b. Generic Diversey #D1231138 32 oz Glance Glass 12/ct $43.71 / case Pacific Star Corp.
10. Spray cleaner / degreaser, 1 gallon container, 4 per case

a. Spray-Nine OR Misco Misco Revite 4/1 gal. 1REP $39.80 / case Allen Paper

b. Generic

4 x 1 Banner AP1012-04

$16.87 / case

Spruce Industries
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CAT. A: CLEANSERS, DEODORIZERS, AND
SPECIAL PURPOSE ITEMS

DESCRIPTION

UNIT / CASE
PRICE

VENDOR

11. Spray cleaner / degreaser, 32 oz. container, 12 per case

a. Spray-Nine OR Misco

12/qts/cs Misco 105658

$38.18 / case

Spruce Industries

b. Generic Simoniz Clean Up CO590012 12/32 oz. $21.80 / case Allen Paper
12. Disinfecting screen wipes, 35 wipes per container, 6 per case
a. Clorox Wipes Clorox #30112 1 ply 7x8 Disinfecting Wipes, 5/ct $71.54 / case Pacific Star Corp.

b. Generic

GJOWT75F Genuine Joe 75wp; 6/ct

$22.15 / case

Office Concepts

13. Mildew stain remover, approx. 32 oz. container, 12 per case

a. Soft Scrub Mold & Mildew Stain Remover OR X-
14 Professional Instant Mildew Stain Remover

Soft Scrub 155198 36 oz. 6/cs DIA-15519

$35.80 / case

RMAC Supplies

b. Generic

Simoniz Bath & Tile 12/32 oz. BO290012

$48.90 / case

Allen Paper

14. Bathroom spray cleaner, approx. 28 oz bottles, 12 per case

a. Lysol Power Bathroom Cleaner Spray OR SC
Johnson Scrubbing Bubbles Foam Bath Cleaner

SC Johnson 30611 32 0z/8/cs

$34.42 / case

United Sales USA

b. Generic

GJ099676CT Genuine Joe 32 oz, 12/ct

$28.69 / case

Office Concepts

15. Bathroom toilet bowl cleaner, approx. 24 oz., 12 per case

a. Lysol Toilet Bowl Cleaner OR Kaboom
Bowlblaster

Lysol 74278 32 o0z/12/cs

$46.14 / case

United Sales USA

b. Generic

Conqueror 5110 32 o0z. 12/cs BC-12

$22.00 / case

RMAC Supplies
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CAT. A: CLEANSERS, DEODORIZERS, AND
SPECIAL PURPOSE ITEMS

DESCRIPTION

UNIT / CASE
PRICE

VENDOR

16. Green bathroom cleaner, approx. 24 oz. container, 12 per case

a. Simple Green All-Purpose Cleaner OR Clorox
Green Works All-Purpose Cleaner

SMP13012CT Simple Green 24 oz; 12/ct

$56.95 / case

Office Concepts

b. Generic

RMAC APC-34 32 oz 12/cs APC - 34

$28.83 / case

RMAC Supplies

17. Green toilet bowl cleaner, approx. 24 oz. container, 12

per case

a. Clorox Green Works Toilet Bowl Cleaner
(Original Fresh) OR Seventh Generation Toilet
Bowl Cleaner

Clorox, CLO00031CT, 24 oz, 12/cs

$39.74 / case

Plastic Express

b. Generic

No Award

No Award

No Award

18. Liquid chlorine bleach, 1 gallon container, 3 per case

a. Clorox

Clorox 30966 3/1 gallon

$22.13 / case

United Sales USA

b. Generic

Kik 1100675S042 3/1 gal.

$18.14 / case

United Sales USA

19. Floor finish, ABSOLUTELY NO BUFF, 5 gallon drum

a. Hard Head

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

b. Generic

5/gal. Banner — FW213 - 05

$49.99 / drum

Spruce Industries

20. Toilet deodorant blocks, 12 per box

a. Generic

Janico 12/box round 12-USPBN nonparacherry

$12.50 / box

Allen Paper

21. Urinal screens with cleaner block, 12 per box
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CAT. A: CLEANSERS, DEODORIZERS, AND UNIT / CASE
SPECIAL PURPOSE ITEMS Lleseab ek, PRICE HlEel
a. Generic Janico 7003 12/box $15.05 / box United Sales USA

22. Liquid drain opener, approx. 80 oz. container, 6 per case

a. Liquid Plumr Pro-Strength Full Clog Destroyer i _ :
Plus PipeGuard OR Drano Max Gel Pro Strength PLUMR - #CL000228, 80 oz — 6/case $61.99 / case Plastic Express
b. Generic

23. Odor eliminator / freshener / deodorant

a. Clorox Odor Defense OR Febreze Alr, aerosol Febreze PGC 97799CT, 8.8 oz, 12/cs $42.00 / case W.B. Mason
spray, 14 oz., 12 per case
b. Generic aerosol spray Simoniz Tropic Breeze 12/20 oz. S3348012 $49.80 / case Allen Paper
c. Clorox Odor Defense OR Febreze Air, 32 oz. . .
trigger spray, 9 per case Febreze Air PGC97589 27 oz 4/cs $25.00 / case Olympic Glove
d. Generic trigger spray Febreze Air PGC97589 27 oz 4/cs $25.00 / case Olympic Glove
e. Clorox Odor' Defense Air & Fabric OR Febreze, 1 Febreze Professional Deep 1 Gal, 3/case $97.21 / case Plastic Express
gallon container, 4 per case
f.  Generic, 1 gallon container Banner Spray Deodorant D06010-04 4/1 gal. $38.90 / case Allen Paper
24. Black ant and roach insect spray, approx. 16 oz. container, 12 per case
a. Generic Simoniz S3373012 Flying & Crawling Insect & Bed $53.60 / case Allen Paper

Bug Killer 12/20

25. Wasp spray, fast knockdown, residually effective, must

kill bees, hornets, scorpions, spiders and yellow jackets, spray distance minimum of 10.5
feet, stream-type spray, approx. 16 oz. container, 12 per case

a.

Raid OR Spectricide

Raid, #01353, 14 oz — 12/case

$76.99 / case Plastic Express
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CAT. A: CLEANSERS, DEODORIZERS, AND UNIT / CASE
SPECIAL PURPOSE ITEMS LEaE L. PRICE HEb e
b. Generic Simoniz $3369012 Bee Wash & Hornet 12/20 g. $75.90 / case Allen Paper

26. Ice removing pellets, NO BAGS, NO ROCK SALT, NO CALCIUM CHLORIDE, approx. 40 Ib. containers

a. Safe Step Environ-Blend 6300, non-toxic, melts

Safe Step - #56840, 40 |Ib

$42.52 / container

Plastic Express

iceupto-10F
b. Generic No Bid No Bid No Bid
27. Liquid hand soap for dispensers, approx. 1250 mil container, 3 per case, must be compatible with Dispenser #5150-06
a. GOJO Luxury Foam, #5161-03 or #5161-04 Gojo Industries, Inc #5161-04 1,250 mL 3/ct $73.26 / case Pacific Star Corp.
b. Dermapro PROVON #5186-03 1, 250 mL 3/ct $77.40 / case Pacific Star Corp.
c. Generic No Award No Award No Award
28. Hand soap dispenser refill bag with spout, 800 ml, 12 per case
a. Simoniz P2400800 Simoniz Phlo in a box P2400800 12/800 mL $30.80 / case Allen Paper
b. Generic Simoniz Phlo in a box P2400800 12/800 mL $30.80 / case Allen Paper

29. Hand sanitizer, pump bottle, approx. 12 oz., 12 per cas

]

a. Purell Hand Sanitizer Gel

Purell — 3659 - 12

$58.53 / case

Spruce Industries

b. Generic

GJO10465 Genuine Joe 8 oz; 12/ct

$49.78 / case

Office Concepts

30. Bar hand soap, individually wrapped, approx. 3 oz. size, 96 per case
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CAT. A: CLEANSERS, DEODORIZERS, AND
SPECIAL PURPOSE ITEMS

DESCRIPTION

UNIT / CASE

PRICE VENDOR

a. Ivory OR Dove

Ivory, PGC12364 3.1 oz, 72/carton

$49.94 / case United Sales USA

b. Generic

Dove UNI61073 2.6 oz 35/cs

$45.00 / case Olympic Glove

31. Air freshener dispenser, wall mounted
a. Rubbermaid Programmable Microburst 3000 Rubbermaid #1793532 $34.08 / each Plastic Express
. Claire Metered air freshener dispenser
b. Generic CLRCL7MAD15P $27.50 / each Allen Paper
32. Air refreshener refill, aerosol spray, approximately 2.6 oz., 12/pack, must be compatible with #31 above
a. Rubbermaid aerosol spray Rubbermaid #FG401690 12/case $73.07 / case Plastic Express
. Claire Metered air freshener Fresh Linen 12/cs
b. Generic CLRC110 $52.50 / case Allen Paper
33. Hand dryer, wall mount, cast iron, swivel nozzle,
push button, 115 volts, World Dryer #A-974AU or SANIFLOW #E88-UL Each $400.39 / each Pacific Star Corp.
equiv.
34. Baby changing station, horizontal, flush wall mount,
polypropylene, Rubbermaid #FG781888LPLAT or Rubbermaid #FG781888 EACH $266.45 / each Plastic Express
equiv.
35. Liquid dish soap, 1 gallon containers, 4 per case
a. Dawn Professional OR Palmolive Ultra Palmolive CPC46157 900z 4/cs $30.15 / each United Sales USA
b. Generic Simoniz Pure Pink 4/1 gal P2705004 $16.90 / case Allen Paper
36. Dishwasher detergent tabs, approx. 85 tablets per box, 4 per case
a. Finish Powerball Mega Pack OR Cascade Action | ;. R Ac97330CT 94/bx 4/cs $86.00 / case Olympic Glove

Pack
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CAT. A: CLEANSERS, DEODORIZERS, AND UNIT / CASE
SPECIAL PURPOSE ITEMS DI=EdlTeL. PRICE e
b. Generic Finish RAC97330CT 94/bx 4/cs $86.00 / case Olympic Glove
37. Laundry detergent pods, approx. 97 pods per pack, 4 per case
a. Arm & Hammer 2-in-1 Power Packs OR Tide No Award No Award No Award
Pods
b. Generic No Award No Award No Award
CAT. B: UTILITY PRODUCTS DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE VENDOR
1. Floor strip pads, 3/4” thick, 17" size, 5 per case ?;?fessmnal Choice Stripping Pads S/cs. PC17BLA $12.50 / case Allen Paper

2. Floor strip or buff pads, 3/4” thick, 20” size, 5 per
case

Americo - 404417

$13.06 / case

Spruce Industries

3. 5 gallon pails & mop wringers (with casters)

Grizzly S34100 32 gt. each ETW-S34100

$58.67 / each

RMAC Supplies

4. Johnny mops, 12", 100 per case

BWKO00160, Boardwalk 127, 25/case

$23.22 / case

United Sales USA

5. Mop sticks, wingnut style, heavy duty, clamp-type, 12

Ocedar Quick Change Fiberglass Mop Handles

per case OCED96516 12/cs $174.00 / case Allen Paper
6. Wet mop handles, presslock, clamp-type TOUCH GUY #1TZA8 60" Each $24.68 / each Pacific Star Corp.
7. Mop heads, cotton, 4 ply, sewed ends & looped, 24 Rubbermaid Commercial #FGD15306WHOO large, $74.68 / case Pacific Star Corp.
0z., 6 per case 6/ct
8. Sp’?nge_ ro_IIer mop,.pull handle and squeeze to wring, | Rubbermaid Commercial #FG643500BRNZ 12 $50.37 / each Pacific Star Corp.
127, Quickie or equiv. Each
9. Sponge mop refill, must be compatible with #8 above | Rubbermaid Commercial #FG643600YEL Each $24.02 / each Pacific Star Corp.
10. Dust mops (complete) Boardwalk #BWKHL365BSPC 60" Each $39.79 / each Pacific Star Corp.
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CAT. B: UTILITY PRODUCTS DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE VENDOR
11. Dust mops (REFILL ONLY), must be compatible with | g - 4\ 48WK1136 36x5 Each $23.08 / each Pacific Star Corp.

#10 above
12. Corn brooms Janico 4049 each 30” longx 7/8” $3.55/ each United Sales USA
13. ?t\)/\ge?glg brush, outdoor, heavy duty, course stiff Rubbermaid Commercial #2018727 18” Each $51.42 / each Pacific Star Corp.
14. Floor brush, 18", 60" handle: Soardwalk #BWI20218, BWI136 187, 60" handle $23.36 / each Pacific Star Corp.
15. Push broom handles, screw-type, 54” high AMPCO SAFETY TOLLS #112559C 54" Each $57.44 |/ each Pacific Star Corp.
16. Broom handles, metal thread, 60” high Boardwalk BWK136 60” each $4.84 / each United Sales USA
17. Dust pans (plastic), 12" opening TOL280169 12” Black Dust Pan $4.50 / each Allen Paper
18. Counter brushes, 8” Boardwalk BWK5308 8” each $3.41/ each United Sales USA
19. Plastic trigger hand sprayers (triggers only), 1 qt. size | RMAC 58109 qt. size each BWK-58109 $0.52 / each RMAC Supplies
20. Plastic trigger hand sprayers (bottles and triggers), . i .

Boardwalk BWK03010 or equiv., 1 gt size RMAC 32BWT qt. size each RMA-32BWT $1.06 / each RMAC Supplies
21. “:'5?2352’ cellulose, large, approximately 4" X 7°, 24 | papges advantage Yellow Sponge Large 24/cs $47.00 / case Allen Paper
22. Scrubbing sponges, medium duty, 20 per box Niagara 174 Med Duty 20/box PAD-174 $14.47 / box RMAC Supplies
23. Scouring pads, medium duty, 20 per case Americo 510118 20/cs $6.46 / case Spruce Industries
24. Utility pads, brown strip, 20 per case ﬁg\ﬁ? Ege Brown Utility Pads 4/10 4/5/case $19.90 / case Allen Paper
25. Anti-microfiber, anti-microbial cloths, approximately

16” x 16” (launderable), glass/mirrors, 12 per pack Pro 16x16 Microfiber LK300 clothes 12/pk green $10.80 / pack Allen Paper

(green)
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CAT. B: UTILITY PRODUCTS DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE VENDOR
26. Anti-microfiber, anti-microbial cloths, approximately
16” x 16” (launderable), general purpose cleaning, 12 | Pro 16x16 Microfiber clothes 12/pk. Blue LK600 $10.80 / pack Allen Paper
per pack (blue)
27. Anti-microfiber, anti-microbial cloths, approximately
16” x 16” (launderable), bathrooms, 12 per pack Pro 16x16 Microfiber clothes 12/pk yellow LK700 $10.80 / pack Allen Paper
(yellow)
28. Razor blades, single edge, 100 per box Sparco Products #11820 100/box $24.32 / box Pacific Star Corp.
29. Recycling boxes, blue, 14 gallon, rectangular tote, 6 per case
a. Rubbermaid Rubbermaid RCP571473BE 14 gal $180.00 / case Olympic Glove
b. Generic No Bid No Bid No Bid
30. Bulk recycling containers, can with wheels and hinged top, 50 gallon capacity, blue, heavy duty
a. Rubbermaid Rubbermaid RCP9W2772BLU 50 gal $115.00 / each Olympic Glove
b. Generic No Bid No Bid No Bid
31. Lawn/leaf bags, heavy duty 2-ply craft paper,
biodegradable, compostable, moisture resistant, 30 AJMRBR30105B0O AJAM 50/ct $38.68 / case Office Concepts
gallon capacity, 60 per carton
32. Garbage bags, heavy duty contractor grade, 3 mil thickness, 55 — 60 gallon capacity, black, 15 per carton
a. Uline Uline #S-18435 39x58, 15/cs $38.00 / case Central Poly-Bag
. INT-3858 Super Exh, Count: 15, Size 38x53, mfr: Interboro
b. Generic Interplast, color: bk $5.24 / carton Packaging
33. Trash can liners, industrial grade, 2.5 mil thickness, 44 — 55 gallon capacity, clear, 100 per carton

a. Uline

Uline #S-3529 36x58, 100/cs

$130.00 / carton

Central Poly-Bag
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CAT. B: UTILITY PRODUCTS DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE VENDOR
b, Generic I3I\é')|2;33666c(;)é150);h0|}gfarr Interplast, Count: 100, Size $23.32 / carton FI)r;téekrggi;og
34. Trash can liners, industrial grade, 1.5 mil thickness, 44 — 55 gallon capacity, clear, 100 per carton
a. Uline Uline #S-2055 36x58, 100/cs $92.00 / case Central Poly-Bag
b. Generic ghé'l);gg?%)(j(()l:,(l;/llézrlnterplast, Count:100; Size $18.48 / carton Flzf;:gi:qog

35.

Trash can liners, coreless, light strength, .23 mil thickness, 7 — 10 gallon capacity, 1000 per carton

a. Uline S-7322 Uline 1000/ct $44.95 / carton Office Concepts

b. Generic RMAC 242406C 123 miL 1000/cs 242406C $10.50 / carton RMAC Supplies
36. Trash bags, kitchen-type, 13 gallon capacity, white or black, 400 per carton

a. Uline S-15583 Uline 400/ct $89.60 / carton Office Concepts

. INT-2433-L, Mfr: Interplast, Count: 400; Size: 24x22; Interboro

b.  Generic Color: Black $6.82/ carton Packaging
37. Dog waste bags, Dogipot Dog Waste Bags or equiv.,

8” x 13”, 1” core, 200 bags per box, 10 boxes per Poopy Pouch T9FB2047869 10 bx/ 200rl/ case $78.00 / case Allen Paper

carton. Must come in dispenser box.
38. Paper grocery bags, approximately 12” x 77 x 17”, 1/6 | Ross & Wallace RW 1-6 #57 Natural Paper Sack

barrel, kraft, 500 per carton 500/pk $45.00/ carton Allen Paper
39. Gloves, cotton brown jersey, knit wrist, men’s/women’s sizes, 12 pairs per case

a. Youth sizes G&F Products #1823-3 Kid Size 6 Pair $38.61/ case Pacific Star Corp.

b. Adult sizes Work Gloves 4408 9 oz. Brown Jersey Work Gloves $16.90 / case Allen Paper

12 pairs/cs
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CAT. C: PAPER AND RELATED ITEMS

DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE

VENDOR

1.

Toilet tissue, bleached, wrapped, facial quality, 2-
ply, approximately 500 sheets per roll, 96 rolls per
case:

Atlas 248 500 Sheets 96 rolls/cs

$29.70 / case

United Sales USA

2. Toilet tissue, bleached, wrapped, facial quality, 1-ply,
approximately 1,000 sheets per roll, 96 rolls per Atlas 115 1000 sheets 96 rolls/cs $40.21 / case United Sales USA
case:
3. Toilet tissue, approximately 12" diameter, 2-ply, Atlas 062 6 rolls/case $18.98 / case United Sales USA
jumbo roll, 6 rolls per case:
4. Toilet tissue, jumbo roll, 2-ply, approximately 10” . i .
diameter, 1000’, 12 rolls per case: Triple S - 76023 $29.82 / case Spruce Industries
5. Toilet tissue, jumbo roll, 1-ply, approximately 10” . .
diameter, 1000’, 3" core, 12 rolls per case: Nittany 5207 $24.29 / case United Sales USA
6. Disposable paper toilet seat covers, white, 5,000 Crystal Ware TSCR20250 5000 covers $47.50 / case United Sales USA
covers per case:
7. Facial tissues, 2-ply, 30 boxes per case: RMAC FT30 100 Sheets-Box FT30 30 boxes/cs $14.50 / case RMAC Supplies
8. Paper towels, white, c-fold, 2,400 per case: Marcal P100B 2400 per case $16.56 / case United Sales USA
9. Paper towels, multi-fold, approximately 10" x 10", Nittany MFN4000 4000/cs $16.90 / case United Sales USA
4,000 per case:
10. Roll paper towels, kitchen-type, 85 sheets per roll, 30 rolls per case
a. Bounty OR Bounty Basics OR Scott: Bounty PGC74682 12 rolls per case $14.35/ case United Sales USA
b. Generic: RMAC HHRT30 85 sh/roll 30/cs HHRT30 $25.20 / case RMAC Supplies
11. Paper towels, 30 Ib. weight, bleached, approximately
9” x 8.5”, notched ends, 500 sheets per roll, 12 rolls No Award No Award No Award
per case:
12. Paper towels, 30 Ib. weight, unbleached, natural,
approximately 9” x 8.5”, notched ends, 500 sheets GEN #GENHWTKRFT 1-ply, 8” x 600 ft, 12 RL/CT $86.16 / case Pacific Star Corp.

per roll, 12 rolls per case:
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CAT. C: PAPER AND RELATED ITEMS

DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE

VENDOR

13. Hard roll towels, white, approximately 8” x 900’, 6
rolls per case:

SKC 0 USRB800 6/cs

$19.96 / case

United Sales USA

14. Sanitary napkins, individually wrapped, 250 per case: | HOSPECO #MT-4 Maxi 250/pk $81.83 / pack Pacific Star Corp.
15. ('\:/;asz?ine tampons, individually wrapped, 500 per Tampons 500/cs. Impact $69.00 / case Allen Paper
16. (S:::;t:ary napkin disposal bags, waxed, 1,200 per Sanisac Hospeco 500/cs Receptable Bags $34.50 / case Allen Paper
17. Paper cups, 3 oz. size, 5,000 per case:
a. Dixie OR Solo SOLO SCC44CT 3 oz 100/bg 50 bg/cs $253.00 / case Olympic Glove
b. Generic SOLO SCC4450 3.5 oz 100/bg 50 bg/cs $175.00 / case Olympic Glove

18. Paper cups to hold HOT liquids, 8 oz. size, biodegradable, 1,000 per case:

a. Dixie OR Dart

DXE2338PATH Dixie 1000/ct

$84.66 / case

Office Concepts

b. Generic

RMAC CUPS8P 8 oz. Hot Cups white 1,000/cs
CUP8P

$31.85/ case

RMAC Supplies

19. Paper cups to hold HOT liquids, 12 oz. size, biodegrad

able, 1,000 per case

a. Dixie OR Dart

DXE2342PATHCT Dixie 1000/ct

$115.85 / case

Office Concepts

b. Generic

CUP12P 1,000- case

RMAC CUP12P HOTCUP 12 oz 50 — pack 20-cs

$42.27 | case

RMAC Supplies

Boardwalk #BWK1020SLEEVE Fits 10 oz to 20 oz

20. Paper cup sleeves, 1,200 per case Hot Cups 1200/ct $58.62 / case Pacific Star Corp.
21. Paper cups to hold COLD liquids, 5 oz. size, non-treated, 2,400 per case
a. Dixie OR Dart DART #y5 5 oz 2500/ct $97.35/ case Pacific Star Corp/
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CAT. C: PAPER AND RELATED ITEMS

DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE

VENDOR

b. Generic

GJO10436 Genuine Joe 2500/ct

$61.24 / case

Office Concepts

22. Paper bowls, 12 oz. size, 1,000 per case

a. Dixie OR Solo Dixie DXESX12PATH 12 oz 1000/cs $102.00 / case Olympic Glove
b. Generic (P:(aasr:t 12 oz. bagasse bowl KE-BBR12-1C 20/50 per $52.00 / case Allen Paper
23. Plastic disposable portion cups with lids

a. Portion cup, Karat or equiv., clear, 2 oz., 2,500 Choice #127P2C 2 0z 2500/cs $30.60 / case Pacific Star Corp.
per case

b. Portion cup lids, Karat or equiv., 2 02., 2,500 per | o, o 4127p12 1.5 10 2.5 oz lid 2500/cs $26.97 / case Pacific Star Corp
case, must be compatible with 23a above

c CF;‘;::'O” cup, Karat or equiv., 4 0z., 1,000 per Karat C-KDPYW 1000/cs $59.00 / case Allen Paper

d. Portion cup lids, Karat or equiv., 4 0z, 1,000 per | ) 76 karat id 1000/cs $58.00 / case Allen Paper

case, must be compatible with 23c above

24. Paper plates, poly coated, heavy duty, 125 per pack:

a. 9 plates, Dixie OR Solo

DXEUX9WS Dixie 125/pk

$15.87 / pack

Office Concepts

b. 9” plates, generic

GJO10320 Genuine Joe 125/pk

$14.08 / pack

Office Concepts

c. 7’ plates, Dixie OR Solo

DXEUX7WSPK Dixie 125/pk

$12.59 / pack

Office Concepts

d. 7’ plates, generic AJM Packaging 125/pkg. #23058960 $9.50 / pack Allen Paper
e. 6 plates, Dixie OR Solo No Bid No Bid No Bid
f. 6" plates, generic No Award No Award No Award
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CAT. C: PAPER AND RELATED ITEMS

DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE

VENDOR

25. Plastic cutlery, heavy duty weight, white, 1,000 per case:

a. Forks, Dixie OR Solo

DXEFH217 Dixie 1000/ct

$50.26 / case

Office Concepts

b. Forks, generic

RMAC HW Fork Fork-HD Fork-HD 1,000/cs

$16.00 / case

RMAC Supplies

c. Knives, Dixie OR Solo

Dixie #KH217 1000/ct

$70.53 / case

Pacific Star Corp.

d. Khnives, generic

RMAC HD Khnives Knive-HD Knive-HD 1,000/cs

$16.00 / case

RMAC Supplies

e. Spoons, Dixie OR Solo

Dixie #SH217 1000/ct

$67.62 / case

Pacific Star Corp.

f. Spoons, generic

RMAC HD Teaspoon TSPOON-HD TSPOON-HD
1,000 c/s

$16.00 / case

RMAC Supplies

26.

Meal kit (4 piece) including fork, knife, spoon and
napkin, wrapped, 250 per case

Wellchoice #4KHPW white meal kits 250/cs

$16.90 / case

Allen Paper

27.

Luncheon napkins, paper, white, single ply, quarter fold, 100% recyclable, 5,000 per case:

a. Marcal OR Bounty

MRC6506CT Marcal 2400/ct

$38.16 / case

Office Concepts

b. Generic

GJ0O11252 Genuine Joe 4000/ct

$23.80 / case

Office Concepts

28. Aluminum foil wrap for food, everyday weight, No Award No Award No Award
approx. 200 sq ft

29. Aluminum foil wrap for food, heavy duty weight, No Award No Award No Award
approx. 130 sq ft

30. Plastic/saran wrap for food, approx. 225 sq ft No Award No Award No Award

31. Plastic food storage bags, sandwich size, approx. No Award No Award No Award
300 per box

32. E('frsgfxfo"d storage bags, quart size, approx. 150 Ziploc #316962 1 qt. 1.15 mil, 6.5” x 5.89", 100/box $26.44 | box Pacific Star Corp.

33. Plastic food storage bags, gallon size, approx. 80 per | .\ 4314475 1 gal, 10.75” x 10.56, 75/box $26.52 / box Pacific Star Corp.

box
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CAT. C: PAPER AND RELATED ITEMS DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE VENDOR

34. Plastic food storage containers with lids, 28 oz., 50 No Award No Award No Award
per pack

35. Plastic food storage containers with lids, 16 oz., 48 No Award No Award No Award
per pack

36. Plastic disposable table covers, premium quality,
rectangular, 54” x 108", assorted colors (must be Tablemate #549-BK 54 x 108" 6/pk $23.94 / pack Pacific Star Corp.

available in red, white, blue) (color to be
determined at time of order)
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